
Base Bid Bid Item Qty- tons Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price

4.8.1.

CITY OF COLUMBIA 92% SODIUM CHLORIDE 

(Pre-Fill) Tons 1500 $105.45 $158,175.00 $115.57 $173,355.00

4.8.2. Sodium Chloride for Pre Fill 4136 $84.95 $351,353.20 $82.90 $342,874.40 $110.08 $455,290.88 $85.64 $354,207.04

4.8.3.

CITY OF COLUMBIA 92% SODIUM CHLORIDE 

(Replenishment)  Tons 500 $119.76 $59,880.00

4.8.4. Sodium Chloride for Replenishment 2911 $83.90 $244,232.90 $118.08 $343,730.88 $94.64 $275,497.04

Renewals

4.8.5. a.

4.8.5. b.

4.8.6.

2.15. a.

4.9.

NO BIDS Cargill, Incorporated

Sodium Chloride for Replenishment

Restrictions for deliveries less than 100 tons?

Bid Bond Included (5%)

(Scanned copy acceptable for electronic submissions)

Cooperative Purchasing for other government entities:

Yes

Yes

02-31MAR25 - SODIUM CHLORIDE (ROCK SALT) - TERM & SUPPLY

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

List Name and Source of Supply:

List Name and Source of Supply:

List Name and Source of Supply:

List Name and Source of Supply:

Bid Item

Sodium Chloride for Pre-Fill

Maximum Percentage (%)  

Increase 

4%

4%

25 Ton Minimum or Full 

Truck Load

Central Salt, LLC

Lyons Mine - Lyons, KS

Lyons Mine - Lyons, KS

Lyons Mine - Lyons, KS

Lyons Mine - Lyons, KS

22-25 Ton Minimum Order

Yes

Yes

15%

BID TABULATION Independent Salt, LLC

Independent Salt, LLC - 

Kanopolis, KS Mine

Kansas Salt, LLC - 

Hutchinson, KS Mine

Kansas Salt, LLC - 

Hutchinson, KS Mine

7%

7%

N/A

N/A

Compass Minerals

Cote Blanche, LA

Cote Blanche, LA

Maximum Percentage (%)  

Increase 

15%

No

Yes

None

No

25 Ton Minimum Order

No

Independent Salt, LLC - 

Kanopolis, KS Mine

Maximum Percentage (%)  

Increase 

Kansas Salt, LLC

Maximum Percentage (%)  

Increase 

10%

No Bid

Kansas Salt, LLC - 

Hutchinson, KS Mine
N/A

N/A N/A


